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Finance 

 
Module 

 

 
Learning Outcomes 

 
Methods of Teaching 

Module I 
Role of Government in 
Economy 
 

1). At the end of this module 
student will be able to 
understand the scope of Public 
Finance 
2). The students will be able to 
understand the role of 
Government when market fails. 
 

Chalk and Talk, 
Demonstration, Case study 

 
Module II Public Revenue 
 

1). The student will be able to 
learn various sources of Tax and 
Non-Tax Revenue. 
2). The students will get 
introduced with various sources 
of taxes and economic effects 
of taxation. 
 

Chalk and Talk, Case Study 

Module III 
Public Expenditure and Public 
Debt 
 

1). The students will be able to 
learn various theories 
associated with public 
expenditure 
2). This module will enable the 
students to classify public debts 
 

Case Study and Group 
Discussions. 

Module IV 
Fiscal Policy and Management 
 

1). At the end of this module 
students will get an idea of 
functioning of fiscal policy. 
 
2). The students will be able to 
understand various terms 
associated with budget. 
3). Students will learn the 
Rationale for Fiscal Federalism  
 

Chalk and Talk,     
Demonstration 

 


